
ls l ington
Primary (are Trust

Our Ref: IPCT/FO|/0326

02 September 2008

338-346 GoswellRoad
London, EClV 7LQ

Tel: [020]7527 '1000
Fax [020] 7527 100'l

www. isli ngtonpct.nhs. uk

Barbara Jacobson
19 Charles Rowan House
Margery Street
London
WCIX OEH

Dear Ms Jacobson,

I am writing with regards to the enquiry you made to lslington PCT for information relating to
Finsbury Health Centre. I will reply to your questions in the order that you asked them
within your letter, a copy of which is attached. .

1. We have no knowledge of any consultation in 2003 by SparkNow. I enclose the 2OO7
Conservation Management Plan.

2,3, 4. We believe that we are exempt from providing this information in accordance with
Section 43 of the Freedom Of lnformation Act 2000.

5. In order for us to respond to this question, please specify which 'studies' you are
referring to.

6. The PCT still retains LIFT monies relating to Finsbury Health Centre.

7. lslington PCT has not made a decision to sell Finsbury Health Centre.

Please find attached minutes for the Board meetings held on 20 July 2006; 24 May
2007;3 April 2008 and 22 May 2008 which refer to Finsbury Health Centre.

lslington PCT does not hold any minutes of CICS, or CSPC (CPCS does not exist),
' and Camden & lslington PCT does not and never has existed.

8. We do not hold any records of previous ownership of Finsbury Health Centre.

9. We do not hold copies of any agreements governing the transfer of Finsbury Health
Centre land, and have no knowledge of any such agreements.

10. Neither CSPC nor CICS have any powers to do anything with Finsbury Health
Centre. lslington PCT has the power to sell or transfer Finsbury Health Centre.

\-thope you find this information useful, however, if you are dissatisfied with this response,
the PCT operates a complaints procedure, details of which can be found at the bottom of
this letter.
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lf you require any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours sincerely,

Richard Freeman - Head of Corporate Management
lslington PCT
338-346 Goswell Road
London, EClV 7LQ
Phone:0207527 1066
Fax:020 7527 8361
Email : richard.freeman@islingtonpct. nhs. uk

FOI Complaints The lnformation Commissioner:
Chief Executive Office http://www.informationcommissioner.qov.uk
lslington PCT FOI Compliance Team (complaints)
338-346 Goswell Road Wycliffe House
London, ECIV 7tQ Water l.ane, Wllmslow
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